

**City of Florissant  
Golf Course Bridge Deck Asphalt Surface Sealing**

			<i>Company</i>		<i>Company</i>		<i>Company</i>	
			<b>Spencer Contracting</b>		<b>McConnells of St. Louis, Inc.</b>		<b>Missouri Petroleum Products Company, LLC</b>	
			3073 Arnold Tenbrook Road Arnold, MO 63010		2646 Creve Coeur Drive Saint Louis, MO 63144		1620 Woodson Road Saint Louis, MO 63114	
<i>Item</i>	<i>Qty</i>	<i>Description</i>	<i>Unit</i>	<i>Total</i>	<i>Unit</i>	<i>Total</i>	<i>Unit</i>	<i>Total</i>
1)	3,668 (+/- 300)	Chip Seal (steep slope area)	\$8.00	\$29,344.00	\$5.51	\$20,210.68	No Bid	No Bid
2)	30,241 (+/- 3,000)	Seal Coating (flat surface)	\$1.18	\$35,684.38	\$1.65	\$49,897.65	No Bid	No Bid
2A)	30,241 (+/- 3,000)	Alternate: Asphalt Emulsion Sealer (Endura Seal or Equal)	\$1.25	\$37,801.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3)	1,429 (+/- 100)	Bridge Deck Chip Sealing	\$18.00	\$25,722.00	\$6.22	\$8,888.38	\$13.15	\$18,791.35
<b>TOTAL (Not on Bid Sheet)</b>				<b>\$128,551.63</b>		<b>\$78,996.71</b>		<b>\$18,791.35</b>
4)		Federal Apprenticeship Policy		100%		0%		85%
		Discount		0%		0%		0%